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the nature of the hazard and the appro-
priate precautions to avoid potential 
accident, injury, or damage. 

(b) Examples. The statements in this 
paragraph illustrate the types of haz-
ard statements that EPA may require 
and the circumstances under which 
they are typically required. These 
statements are not comprehensive; 
other statements may be required if 
more appropriate to the formulation or 
use. 

(1) If a pesticide intended for outdoor 
use contains an active ingredient with 
a mammalian acute oral LD50 of 100 
mg/kg or less, the statement, ‘‘This 
pesticide is toxic to wildlife’’ is re-
quired. 

(2) If a pesticide intended for outdoor 
use contains an active ingredient with 
a fish acute LC50 of 1 ppm or less, the 
statement, ‘‘This pesticide is toxic to 
fish’’ is required. 

(3) If a pesticide intended for outdoor 
use contains an active ingredient with 
an avian acute oral LD50 of 100 mg/kg 
or less, or a subacute dietary LC50 of 
500 ppm or less, the statement, ‘‘This 
pesticide is toxic to wildlife’’ is re-
quired. 

(4) If either accident history or field 
studies demonstrate that the use of the 
pesticide may result in fatality to 
birds, fish or mammals, the statement, 
‘‘This pesticide is extremely toxic to 
wildlife (fish)’’ is required. 

(5) If a product is intended for or in-
volves foliar application to agricul-
tural crops, forests or shade trees, or 
mosquito abatement treatments, and 
contains a pesticide toxic to polli-
nating insects, the label must bear ap-
propriate label cautions. 

(6) If a product is intended for out-
door use other than aquatic applica-
tions, the label must bear the caution, 
‘‘Keep out of lakes, ponds or streams. 
Do not contaminate water by cleaning 
of equipment or disposal of wastes.’’

Subparts F–J [Reserved]

Subpart K—Worker Protection 
Statements

SOURCE: 57 FR 38146, Aug. 21, 1992, unless 
otherwise noted.

§ 156.200 Scope and applicability. 

(a) Scope. (1) This subpart prescribes 
statements that must be placed on the 
pesticide label and in pesticide label-
ing. These statements incorporate by 
reference the Worker Protection 
Standard, part 170 of this chapter. The 
requirements addressed in these state-
ments are designed to reduce the risk 
of illness or injury resulting from 
workers’ and pesticide handlers’ occu-
pational exposures to pesticides used in 
the production of agricultural plants 
on agricultural establishments as de-
fined in § 170.3 of this chapter. These 
statements refer to specific workplace 
practices designed to reduce or elimi-
nate exposure and to respond to emer-
gencies that may arise from the expo-
sures that may occur. 

(2) This subpart prescribes interim 
requirements that must be placed on 
the pesticide label and in pesticide la-
beling. These interim requirements 
pertain to restricted-entry intervals, 
personal protective equipment, and no-
tification. On a case-by-case basis, 
these interim requirements will be re-
viewed and may be revised during re-
registration or other agency review 
processes. 

(b) Applicability. (1) The requirements 
of this subpart apply to each pesticide 
product that bears directions for use in 
the production of any agricultural 
plant on any agricultural establish-
ment as defined in § 170.3 of this chap-
ter, or whose labeling reasonably per-
mits such use. 

(2) The requirements of this subpart 
do not apply to a product that bears di-
rections solely for uses excepted by 
§ 170.202(b) of this chapter. 

(c) Effective dates. (1) The effective 
date of this subpart is October 20, 1992. 

(2) No pesticide product bearing la-
beling amended and revised as required 
by this subpart shall be distributed or 
sold by a registrant prior to April 21, 
1993. 

(3) No product to which this subpart 
applies shall be distributed or sold 
without amended labeling by any reg-
istrant after April 21, 1994. 

(4) No product to which this subpart 
applies shall be distributed or sold 
without amended labeling by any per-
son after October 23, 1995.
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