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(b) Refunds do not bear interest un-
less required or permitted by law or 
contract. 

§ 20.88 Additional administrative col-
lection action. 

Nothing contained in this subpart is 
intended to preclude the utilization of 
any other administrative remedy 
which may be available. 

§ 20.89 Prior provision of rights with 
respect to debt. 

To the extent that the rights of the 
debtor in relation to the same debt 
have been previously provided by the 
creditor agency under some other stat-
utory or regulatory authority, the 
creditor agency is not required to du-
plicate those efforts before taking sal-
ary offset. 

§ 20.90 Responsibilities of the Chief Fi-
nancial Officer. 

The Chief Financial Officer, or his or 
her designee, shall provide appropriate 
and binding written or other guidance 
to Department of Labor agencies and 
officials in carrying out this subpart, 
including the issuance of guidelines 
and instructions, which he or she may 
deem appropriate. The Chief Financial 
Officer shall also take such administra-
tive steps as may be appropriate to 
carry out the purposes and ensure the 
effective implementation of this sub-
part. 

Subpart E—Federal Income Tax 
Refund Offset 

SOURCE: 59 FR 47250, Sept. 15, 1994, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 20.101 Purpose and scope. 
The regulations in this subpart es-

tablish procedures to implement 31 
U.S.C. 3720A. This statute together 
with implementing regulations of the 
Internal Revenue Service (IRS) at 26 
CFR 301.6402–6, authorizes the IRS to 
reduce a tax refund by the amount of a 
past-due legally enforceable debt owed 
to the United States. The regulations 
apply to past-due legally enforceable 
debts owed to the Department by indi-
viduals and business entities. The regu-
lations are not intended to limit or re-
strict debtor access to any judicial 

remedies to which he/she may other-
wise be entitled. 

§ 20.102 Redelegation of authority. 
Authority delegated by statute or 

IRS regulation to the Secretary or De-
partment is redelegated to the heads of 
the Department’s constituent agencies. 
This authority may be further redele-
gated as necessary to ensure the effi-
cient implementation of these regula-
tions. 

§ 20.103 Definitions. 
For purposes of this subpart: 
(a) Tax refund offset refers to the IRS 

income tax refund offset program oper-
ated under authority of 31 U.S.C. 3720A. 

(b) Past-due legally enforceable debt is 
a delinquent debt administratively de-
termined to be valid, whereon no more 
than 10 years have lapsed since the 
date of delinquency, and which is not 
discharged under a bankruptcy pro-
ceeding or subject to an automatic 
stay under 11 U.S.C. 362. 

(c) Agency refers to the constituent 
offices, administrations and bureaus of 
the Department of Labor. 

(d) Individual refers to a taxpayer 
identified by a social security number 
(SSN). 

(e) Business entity refers to an entity 
identified by an employer identifica-
tion number (EIN). 

(f) Taxpayer mailing address refers to 
the debtor’s current mailing address as 
obtained from IRS. 

(g) Memorandum of understanding re-
fers to the agreement between the De-
partment and IRS outlining the duties 
and responsibilities of the respective 
parties for participation in the tax re-
fund offset program. 

§ 20.104 Agency responsibilities. 
(a) As authorized and required by 

law, each Department of Labor agency 
may refer past-due legally enforceable 
debts to IRS for collection by offset 
from any overpayment of income tax 
that may otherwise be due to be re-
funded to the taxpayer. 

(b) Prior to actual referral of a past- 
due legally enforceable debt for tax re-
fund offset, the DOL agency heads (or 
their designees) must take the actions 
specified in § 20.107 and, as appropriate, 
§ 20.106 and § 20.108. 
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