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§ 91.52 Definitions. 

The definitions supplied by the Coun-
cil on Environmental Quality in its 
Regulations for Implementing the Proce-
dural Provisions of the National Environ-
mental Policy Act, 40 CFR Parts 1500 
through 1508, (CEQ Regulations), shall 
apply to the terms in this subpart. 

§ 91.53 Other guidance. 

The Department of Justice has also 
published NEPA procedures that incor-
porate the CEQ regulations at 28 CFR 
part 61. Additionally, the Office of Jus-
tice Programs’ Corrections Program 
Office has prepared a handbook for 
VOI/TIS grantees, Program Guidance on 
Environmental Protection Requirements. 
This publication and other relevant 
documents can be found at http:// 
www.ojp.usdoj.gov/cpo. 

APPLICATION TO VOI/TIS GRANT 
PROGRAM 

§ 91.54 Applicability. 

(a) Major Federal action. NEPA’s re-
quirements apply to any proposal for 
legislation or other major federal ac-
tion that might significantly impact 
the quality of the human environment. 
The CEQ regulations in 40 CFR 1508.18 
define ‘‘major federal actions’’ as ac-
tions with effects that may be major 
and which are potentially subject to 
Federal control and responsibility. The 
CEQ regulations categorize ‘‘major fed-
eral actions’’ as, among other things, 
the ‘‘[a]pproval of specific projects, 
such as construction or management 
activities located in a defined geo-
graphic area. Projects include actions 
approved by permit or other regulatory 
decision as well as Federal and Feder-
ally assisted activities.’’ (40 CFR 
1508.18(b)(4)). 

(b) VOI/TIS construction grants subject 
to NEPA. This subpart applies to all 
proposed, new and partially completed 
VOI/TIS projects (including projects on 
tribal lands) initiated by state or local 
units of government with grant fund-
ing from OJP that involve construc-
tion, expansion, renovation, facility 
planning, site selection, site prepara-
tion, security or facility upgrades or 
other activities that may significantly 
impact the environment. 

(c) Projects. Although VOI/TIS money 
cannot be used for a project’s oper-
ations expenses, the definition of 
‘‘project’’ or ‘‘proposal’’ for NEPA re-
view purposes is defined as both the 
construction and the long-term oper-
ation of correctional facilities and re-
lated components such as all off-site 
projects to accommodate the needs of 
the correctional facilities project (e.g., 
road and utility construction or expan-
sion, projects offered to the affected 
community as an incentive to accept 
the correctional facility construction 
or expansion, and other reasonably 
foreseeable future actions regardless of 
what agency or third party undertakes 
such action). Reasonably foreseeable 
actions include future prison construc-
tion phases, especially when either cur-
rent acreage requirements or design ca-
pacities for utilities are based on needs 
stemming from future phases. 

§ 91.55 Categorical exclusions. 

Activities undertaken by State, 
local, or tribal entities using VOI/TIS 
funds that are consistent with any of 
the following categories are presumed 
not to have a significant effect on the 
human environment and thus, are cat-
egorically excluded from the prepara-
tion of either an EA or an EIS. Al-
though these activities are excluded 
from environmental reviews under 
NEPA, they are not excluded from 
compliance with other applicable local, 
State, or Federal environmental laws. 
Additionally, an otherwise excluded ac-
tivity loses its exclusion and is subject 
to environmental review if it either 
would be located within or potentially 
affect any of the following: a 100-year 
flood plain, a wetland, important farm-
land, a proposed or listed endangered 
or threatened species, a proposed or 
listed critical habitat, a property that 
is listed or eligible for listing on the 
National Register of Historic Places, 
an area within an approved State 
Coastal Zone Management Program, a 
coastal barrier or a portion of a barrier 
within the Coastal Barrier Resources 
System, a river or portion of a river in-
cluded in or designated for potential 
addition to the Wild and Scenic Rivers 
System, a designated or proposed Wil-
derness Area, or a sole source aquifer 
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recharge area designated by the Envi-
ronmental Protection Agency (EPA). 
The resulting environmental review for 
those activities that lose their exclu-
sion status shall focus on the factor or 
factors that caused the loss of the ex-
clusion. 

(a) Minor renovations. Projects for 
minor renovations within an existing 
facility, unless the renovation would 
impact a structure which is on the Na-
tional Register of Historic Places, or is 
eligible for listing on the register. 

(b) Limited expansion. Projects for the 
expansion of an existing facility or 
within an existing correctional com-
plex, which does not add more than 50 
beds or increase the capacity of the fa-
cility by more than 50 percent which-
ever is smaller. This exclusion does not 
apply to either a phased project that 
exceeds these numerical thresholds or 
projects to expand facilities that: 

(1) Are located in a floodplain; 
(2) Will affect a wetland; 
(3) Will affect a facility on the Na-

tional Register of Historic Places or 
that is eligible for listing on the reg-
ister; 

(4) Will affect a federally proposed or 
listed endangered or threatened species 
or its habitat; 

(5) Is controversial for environmental 
reasons; or 

(6) Would not be served by adequate 
sewage treatment, solid waste disposal, 
or water facilities. 

(c) Expansion of support facilities. 
Projects for the expansion of bed space 
within an existing facility (e.g., double 
bunking or conversion of non-cell 
space) which are using grant funds to 
expand or add support facilities, such 
as a kitchen, medical facilities, rec-
reational space, or program space, to 
accommodate the increased number of 
inmates. This does not include projects 
to increase capacity for support facili-
ties which might pose a threat to the 
environment, such as solid waste and 
waste water management, new roads, 
new or upgraded utilities coming into 
the facility, or prison industry pro-
grams that involve the use of chemi-
cals and produce hazardous waste or 
water or air pollution. 

(d) Security upgrades. Security up-
grades of an existing facility which are 
inside the existing perimeter fence or 

involve the upgrade of the existing pe-
rimeter fence. This exclusion does not 
include such upgrades as adding lethal 
fences or increasing height or lighting 
of a perimeter fence in a residential 
area or other areas sensitive to the vis-
ual impacts resulting from height or 
lighting changes. 

(e) Privatization. Projects that in-
volve the leasing of bed space (which 
may include operational costs) from a 
facility operated by a private correc-
tional corporation or that contract 
with a private correctional corporation 
for the operation of a state facility or 
program. This exclusion does not apply 
if the correctional agency has con-
tracted with the private vendor to 
build the facility, operate the facility, 
or lease beds to the correctional agen-
cy using federal grant funds. 

(f) Drug testing and treatment. 
Projects that use grant funds to imple-
ment drug treatment, testing, sanc-
tions, or interdiction programs. 

§ 91.56 Actions that normally require 
the preparation of an environ-
mental assessment. 

(a) Renovation or expansion of existing 
correctional facility. Renovation or ex-
pansion activities not categorically ex-
cluded under § 91.55 require an environ-
mental assessment (EA). An environ-
mental assessment is generally pre-
pared when a project is not expected to 
have a significant impact on the envi-
ronment. Since projects for the renova-
tion or expansion of an existing facility 
or the construction of a new facility 
within an existing correctional com-
plex may have limited impact on the 
environment, preparing an EA may be 
sufficient. 

(b) Proposed construction of a new cor-
rectional facility. The proposed con-
struction of a new correctional facility 
will require the preparation of an envi-
ronmental assessment unless the pro-
posal will clearly have a significant en-
vironmental impact in which case an 
environmental impact statement can 
be initiated immediately without the 
preparation of an environmental as-
sessment. 
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